

Dumpster Services Bid Tabulation

September 26, 2018 at 1:00pm

Bresnan Meeting Center

Basic Monthly Service

Bidder	AA	Base Bid Subtotal	Sholem	Prairie Farm	Hays	Springer	Virginia
Republic Services	√	\$ 695.08	\$ 194.96	\$ 200.05	\$ 33.34	\$ 66.86	\$ 200.05
Area Disposal	√	\$ 1,198.00	\$ 443.00	\$ 202.00	\$ 63.00	\$ 114.00	\$ 376.00

Additional Dumpsters

2 yard		20 yard		.5 yard	
Basic Service	Per Ton	Basic Service	Per Ton	Basic Service	Per Ton
\$ 45.00	No Bid	\$ 395.00	\$ 45.00	\$ 12.00	No Bid
\$ 49.00	No Bid	\$ 290.00	\$ 44.00	\$ 25.00	No Bid

Opened by: Bridgette Moen

Witness: Cindy Harvey

